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Formalism is a critical approach to literature that focuses on the text itself,
rather than on external factors such as the author's biography or the
historical context in which the work was written. Formalists believe that the
meaning of a literary work is contained within the text itself, and that it can
be discovered through a close reading of the text.

Formalist criticism has been used to analyze a wide range of literary works,
from traditional novels to modernist poetry. However, there is no single,
unified approach to formalist criticism. Different formalist critics have
developed their own unique approaches to the analysis of literature, and
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these approaches have led to the development of a wide range of formalist
terminologies.

In this article, we will compare the use of formalist terminology in two
scholarly articles on literary analysis. The articles, written by different
authors, use different approaches to formalist criticism. We will examine the
implications of these differences for the interpretation of the literary works
that are being analyzed.

The Articles

The first article, "The Formalist Approach to Literary Analysis," is written by
Professor John Smith. Smith is a leading formalist critic, and his article
provides a comprehensive overview of the formalist approach to literary
analysis. In the article, Smith discusses the basic principles of formalism,
as well as the different types of formalist analysis. He also provides
examples of how formalist analysis can be used to interpret literary works.

The second article, "Formalist Criticism and the Interpretation of Modernist
Poetry," is written by Professor Jane Doe. Doe is a modernist scholar, and
her article discusses the use of formalist criticism to interpret modernist
poetry. In the article, Doe argues that formalist criticism is a valuable tool
for understanding modernist poetry, as it allows critics to focus on the
unique formal features of these works. She also provides examples of how
formalist criticism can be used to interpret modernist poetry.

Comparison of Terminology

The two articles use different formalist terminologies. Smith's article uses a
more traditional approach to formalist terminology, while Doe's article uses
a more modern approach.



Smith's article uses terms such as "plot," "character," "setting," and
"theme." These terms are familiar to most readers, as they are commonly
used in literary analysis. However, Smith also uses some more specialized
terms, such as "fabula" and "syuzhet." These terms are less familiar to
most readers, but they are important to Smith's analysis of literary works.

Doe's article uses a more modern approach to formalist terminology. She
uses terms such as "discourse," "intertextuality," and "metafiction." These
terms are less familiar to most readers, but they are important to Doe's
analysis of modernist poetry.

The difference in terminology between the two articles reflects the different
approaches to formalist criticism that the authors are using. Smith's article
uses a more traditional approach to formalist criticism, while Doe's article
uses a more modern approach. This difference in approach leads to
different interpretations of the literary works that are being analyzed.

Implications for Interpretation

The different uses of formalist terminology in the two articles have
implications for the interpretation of the literary works that are being
analyzed. Smith's article provides a more traditional interpretation of the
literary works that he is analyzing, while Doe's article provides a more
modern interpretation.

Smith's article focuses on the traditional elements of literature, such as plot,
character, setting, and theme. He argues that these elements are essential
to understanding the meaning of a literary work. He also argues that the
meaning of a literary work is fixed and unchanging.



Doe's article focuses on the more modern elements of literature, such as
discourse, intertextuality, and metafiction. She argues that these elements
are essential to understanding the meaning of modernist poetry. She also
argues that the meaning of a literary work is not fixed and unchanging, but
rather is constantly being renegotiated by readers.

The different interpretations of the literary works that are being analyzed in
the two articles reflect the different approaches to formalist criticism that the
authors are using. Smith's article uses a more traditional approach to
formalist criticism, while Doe's article uses a more modern approach. This
difference in approach leads to different interpretations of the literary works
that are being analyzed.

The use of formalist terminology in scholarly articles on literary analysis can
have a significant impact on the interpretation of the literary works that are
being analyzed. Different formalist terminologies reflect different
approaches to formalist criticism, and these different approaches lead to
different interpretations of literary works.

In this article, we have compared the use of formalist terminology in two
scholarly articles on literary analysis. The articles, written by different
authors, use different approaches to formalist criticism. We have examined
the implications of these differences for the interpretation of the literary
works that are being analyzed.

We have found that the different uses of formalist terminology in the two
articles have implications for the interpretation of the literary works that are
being analyzed. Smith's article provides a more traditional interpretation of
the literary works that he is analyzing, while Doe's article provides a more



modern interpretation. This difference in interpretation reflects the different
approaches to formalist criticism that the authors are using.

The use of formalist terminology in scholarly articles on literary analysis is a
complex and nuanced issue. There is no single, unified approach to
formalist criticism, and this has led to the development of a wide range of
formalist terminologies. The different uses of formalist terminology reflect
the different approaches to formalist criticism, and these different
approaches lead to different interpretations of literary works.

As readers of scholarly articles on literary analysis, it is important to be
aware of the different formalist terminologies that are being used. This will
help us to understand the different approaches to formalist criticism that are
being used, and to evaluate the different interpretations of literary works
that are being offered.
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